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AREA COMMITTEE PRIORITIES: 2016/17 
 

 

Priority 1 -  Glaisdale Drive Development 

actions 
 

responsibility timescales 

Ensure local people are better able to 
access jobs and training opportunities at 
Glaisdale Drive.  

City Council - Chris Grocock /  
Stacey Shillingford  

ongoing 

Develop and promote Glaisdale Drive 
Employer Network /HUB in partnership 
with City Council and lead body.   

Economic Development 
Groundwork Greater Nottingham 

ongoing 

To promote business units and sites to 
new businesses to maximise employment  
opportunities in this area and reduce the 
level of vacancies.. 

Richard Cox, Property Services  Councillor McCulloch meeting on 25th 
January   (update at Chairs Briefing) 

 

 
Priority 2 -  Jobs and Training 

actions 
 

reasonsibility timescales 

Develop programme of jobs and training 
events in area 3 – to include Construction 
and Care   

Economic Development  Groundwork  
Greater  Nottingham 
Other employment partners - to be 
confirmed (tbc) 

ongoing 



 

 

Identify how best to maintain accurate 
local data for example how many 
interviewed; how many were successful in 
securing jobs ? 

Economic Development ongoing 

Nottingham Jobs Fund – ensure current 
vacancy lists are up to date  

Economic Development March 2016 

Develop Aspley Financial Resilience 
Action Group  

Emma Bates 
Other partners tbc 

ongoing 

Promoting and working with Bilborough 
Talent Match Academy 

Our Bilborough Project / Groundwork 
Greater Nottingham and partners 

ongoing 

Ensure the lead body is working to current 
City Council priorities  

Commissioning bidding process  March 2016 

Ensure local young people are being 
reached and matched to local 
opportunities – Kennington Road 16 -24’s 

Commissioning 
NCH Tenancy Involvement  
Neighbourhood Management   

January / March 2016 
Kennington Road Jobs event – 29th January 

Evaluate impact of Small Steps Big 
Changes funding on women returners 

tbc tbc 

Review new Work Club at Aspley Library  
(Tuesday afternoons drop in: 2-5pm) 

Groundwork Greater Nottingham 
 

New initiative – starts January 2016 ) 

Review Work Club, including outreach 
opportunities, at Bilborough Library 
(Tuesdays 10am -12noon)  

Groundwork Greater Nottingham ongoing – commenced mid 2015 

 
 
 
 
 



 

 

 

Priority 3 -  Health 

actions responsibility timescales 

Use existing information from  Health 
Insight Specialist  for each ward to 
prioritise health issues affecting our 
citizens and in support of the current 
health agenda for the City.  

Health Insight Specialist / NDO’s ongoing 

What services are available locally through 
surgeries  (for example Dr Khaliq, lung 
cancer pilot project in Bilborough)  and 
other key venues for accessing health care 
such as medical practices, colleges and 
children’s centres  

Public Health leads to be identified ongoing 

To promote drugs and alcohol referral 
services  and domestic violence agencies 
within the area through appropriate 
neighbourhood events and activities 

Public Health lead  tbc 
Neighbourhood Action Team   

ongoing 

Contribute towards  local smoking 
cessation plan 

tbc – is this already in place? 2016/17 

Support local projects to address 
loneliness and isolation through continued 
use of  Ward Councillor budgets. 

Councillors  
NDO ‘s  
local partners and  voluntary groups. 

2016/17    

Developing the link between poor health 
and the lack of employment opportunity. 
This action may need to link with local 
mental health provision and welfare rights.  

Note: this action will depend on 
identifying appropriate lead persons  

April 2016 

 


